Memorandum - City of Gulfport

To:  The Honorable Mayor and City Council

From: Connie Debenport, Purchasing Manager

Date: January9,2014

Ref: Term Contract Group J — Ductile Cast Iron Grates & frames

Contract Period 01/01/2014 thru 12-31-2014
Renewable Period 01/01/2015 thru 12/31/2015

I have reviewed the bids received on the above referenced group and recommend
acceptance of the lowest and best bids as submitted by Coburns Supply, HD
Waterworks and MS Utilities. The lowest and best bid is highlighted in each
column.

I have attached a tabulation sheet for your review and approval. Thank you for your
consideration.




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Coburns | Central Pipe|] HD Supply | Mississippi |Southern Pipe
Supply & Supply | Waterworks Utilities & Supply
I |Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
1 |Standard 24” x 24” Grate w/ Frame
EJIW: V-5624 $131.58 $360.00 $334.70 $308.27 $140.00
NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Standard 24” x 24” Grate Only
EJIW: V-5624 $68.42 $196.75 $189.87 $175.00 $76.50
NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate A) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |ADA Compliant 24” x 24” Grate w/ Frame
EJIW: V-5624-80 No Bid $390.00 $363.19 $335.00 No Bid
NFCo: R1879-A6G (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |ADA Compliant 24” x 24” Grate Only
EJIW: V-5624-80 No Bid $228.00 $218.34 $201.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1879-A6G (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-6672-F (Grate Q) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
IT |Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Frames & Covers
1 |Standard 24" Manhole Frame w/Cover
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) $226.32 $370.00 $348.48 $321.00 $250.00
NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid $370.00 $348.48 No Bid No Bid
NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Standard 24" Manhole Cover Only
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) $110.53 $175.00 $158.33 $145.00 $124.00
NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid $175.00 $158.33 No Bid No Bid
NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Hinged 24" Manhole Frame & Cover
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid $427.00 $395.36 $365.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 (Labeled SEWER) . No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid $427.00 $395.36 No Bid No Bid
NFCo:R-1642 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Coburns |Central Pipe| HD Supply Mississippi |Southern Pipe
Supply & Supply | Waterworks Utilities & Supply
4 |Reversible 24" Manhole Frame w/Cover
EJIW: V-1600-3 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid $295.00 $260.56 $240.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: W-1600-3 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid $295.00 $260.56 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R1642-A (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 [Reversible 24" Manhole Cover Only
EJIW: V-1600-3 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid $155.20 $138.77 $129.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: W-1600-3 (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid $155.20 $138.77 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R1642-A (Labeled STORM DRAIN) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |Reversible 26.5" Manhole Cover Only
EJIW: 1090 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1712 (Labeled SEWER) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
II [Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer & Storm Drain Manhole Frames & Covers with custom logo
1 |Standard 24” Manhole Frame w/ Cover
EJIW: 1040 No bid $370.00 $348.48 $321.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 No bid $370.00 $348.48 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 |Standard 24” Manhole Cover Only
EJIW: 1040 No bid $175.00 $158.33 $145.80 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 No bid $175.00 $158.33 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1642 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Hinged 24” Manhole Frame & Cover
EJIW: 1040 No bid $427.00 $395.36 $365.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-LM No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: 1040 No bid $427.00 $395.36 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-LM No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 |Reversable 24” Manhole Frame w/ Cover
EJIW: V-1600-3 No bid $295.00 $260.56 $240.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: V-1600-3 No bid $295.00 $260.56 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Coburns |Central Pipe| HD Supply Mississippi |Southern Pipe
Supply & Supply | Waterworks Utilities & Supply

Reversable 24 Manhole Cover Only

EJIW: V-1600-3 No bid $155.20 $138.77 $128.00 No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EJIW: V-1600-3 No bid $155.20 $138.77 No Bid No Bid
NFCo: R-1642-A No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ductile or Cast Iron Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riser Rings

Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

17 Rise (For 24 x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid $95.11 $88.00 No Bid
2” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid $98.76 $91.00 No Bid

Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

1” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

1 Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid $113.42 $105.00 No Bid
2” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid $122.38 $114.00 No Bid

Ductile or Cast Iron Manhole Riser Ring

17 Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2” Rise (For 26” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Composite Sanitary Sewer and Storm Drain Manhole Riser Rings

Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (For 24” x 1.5” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (For 24” x 2” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5” Rise (For 26” x 1” Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15
Coburns |Central Pipe| HD Supply | Mississippi |Southern Pipe
Supply & Supply | Waterworks Utilities & Supply
5 |Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5" Rise (For 26" x 1.5" Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 |Polypropylene Manhole Riser Ring
1.5" Rise (for 26" x 2" Cover) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
VI |Ductile or cast iron valve boxes
1 |18 - 24" height valve box $24.21 $32.00 $24.50 $26.00 $25.00
Brand Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB261 461-S VB261 VB261 VB261
2 | 24 - 36" height valve box $35.79 $38.00 $35.75 $40.00 $36.00
Brand Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB262 652-S VB262 VB262 VB262
VII |Ductile or cast iron valve box risers
1 |27 $8.52 $9.60 $9.00 $8.88 $9.00
Brand Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB2600 VB2602 VB2600 VB2602
VIII|Ductile or cast iron valve box lids with “Water” or “Sewer” on top
1 [Standard lid $9.09 $9.00 $9.50 $9.50 $9.50
Brand Sigma Star Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N VB2600 VB2600 VB2600 VB2600
IX |Meter boxes (Rome, Vulcan, Jefferson Parish)
1 |Small w/lid $29.47 $38.00 $34.00 $31.00 $32.00
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB282 MB282 MB282 MB282
2 |Large w/lid $82.11 $95.00 $90.00 $95.00 $85.00
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB381 MB381 MB381 MB381




Group J Ductile or Cast Iron Grates & Frames
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Coburns |Central Pipe|] HD Supply Mississippi |Southern Pipe
Supply & Supply | Waterworks Utilities & Supply

Meter box lids only
Small (19 1/8” x 9 %”) $11.36 No Bid $11.50 $12.00 $12.50
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB2821 MB2821 MB2821 MB2821
Large, oval type $31.58 No Bid $36.00 $35.30 $33.00
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB3811 MB3811 MB3811 MB3811
Large, square type $31.58 No Bid $36.00 $35.30 $34.00
Brand Sigma Sigma Sigma Sigma
P/N MB2831 MB2831 MB2831 MB2831
Coburn's Supply HD Supply Waterworks Mississippi Utilities
5271 Hwy 11 14050 White Rd. 14231 Seaway Rd, Unit B-5

Hattiesburg, MS 39402
601-606-0611 - phone
iwilson@coburns.com

Gulfport, MS 39503
228-563-1905 - phone
228-563-6484 - fax
dusty.dysart@hdsupply.com

Gulfport, MS

228-863-2757 - phone
228-863-6587 - fax

william.turner@ferguson.com




