Memorandum - City of Gulfport

To:  The Honorable Mayor and City Council

From: Connie Debenport, Purchasing Manager

Date: January9, 2014

Ref: Term Contract Group C2A — Culvert and Ram Neck Piping

Contract Period 01/01/2014 thru 12-31-2014
Renewable Period 01/01/2015 thru 12/31/2015

[ have reviewed the bids received on the above referenced group and recommend
acceptance of the lowest and best bids as submitted by Hanson Pipe & Precast,
Design Precast & Pipe and Southern Pipe & Supply. The lowest and best bid is
highlighted in each column.

I have attached a tabulation sheet for your review and approval. Thank you for your
consideration.




Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15
Hanson Pipe Design Precast Southern Pipe
& Precast & Pipe & Supply
Section I - Ram Neck, Gasket Only
L. 1"X2'5" 2.15 2.40 No Bid
2.11/2"X 3'5" 3.19 3.78 No Bid
3.13/4"X 35" 4.20 4.35 No Bid
Section II - Round Concrete Pipe ASTM C-76, Class III w/Rubber Gasket
Diameter
1. 15" 13.72 10.85 No Bid
2. 18" 15.17 12.05 No Bid
3. 21" 20.58 No Bid No Bid
4. 24" 25.01 21.70 No Bid
5.27" 30.85 No Bid No Bid
6. 30" 34.68 31.15 No Bid
7. 36" 49.14 40.15 No Bid
8. 42" 61.40 51.15 No Bid
9. 48" 80.00 68.15 No Bid
10. 54" 97.99 85.90 No Bid
11. 60" 118.77 105.50 No Bid
12. 66" 143.86 No Bid No Bid
13. 72" 166.11 151.00 No Bid
14. 84" 224.43 224.00 No Bid
15. 96" No Bid No Bid No Bid
16. 108" No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Hanson Pipe Design Precast Southern Pipe
& Precast & Pipe & Supply

Section III - Concrete Arch - ASTM C-506, Class I1I w/Preformed Mastic

Diameter Per Linear Foot

1. 18X 11 $ 2845 | $ 19.15 No Bid
2. 22X 13 $ 28451 8% 22.95 No Bid
3. 29X 18 $ 3426 | $ 31.21 No Bid
4, 36 X23 $ 4104 | $ 38.05 No Bid
5. 44X27 $ 5690 | $ 52.50 No Bid
6. 51 X 31 $ 7365 $ 69.15 No Bid
7. 58 X 36 $ 93221 % 87.15 No Bid
8. 65X 40 $ 11370 | § 105.65 No Bid
9. 73X 45 $ 14128 | $ 135.15 No Bid
10. 88X 54 $ 251.76 No Bid No Bid
Concrete Flared End Sections

Arch Arch Arch

1. 15" $ 411.00 | $ 350.00 No Bid
2. 18" $ 411.00 | $ 350.00 No Bid
3. 24" $ 472,00 | $ 360.00 No Bid
4. 30" $ 520.00 | $ 410.00 No Bid
5. 36" $ 888.00 | $ 765.00 No Bid
6. 42" $ 1,129.00 | $ 995.00 No Bid
7. 48" $ 1,237.00 | $ 1,000.00 No Bid
8. 54" $ 1,484.00 No Bid No Bid
9. 60" $ 1,901.00 No Bid No Bid
10. 66" $ 2,070.00 No Bid No Bid
11. 72" $ 2,417.00 No Bid No Bid
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Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Hanson Pipe Design Precast Southern Pipe
& Precast & Pipe & Supply

Section IV - HDPE Pipe Water Tight (Bell End) Connection, Smooth Interior

Diameter

1. 15" No Bid No Bid| $ 6.67
2. 18" No Bid No Bid| $ 8.32
3. 24" No Bid No Bid} $ 14.34
4. 30" No Bid No Bid| $ 20.36
5. 36" No Bid No Bid| $ 27.36
6. 42" No Bid No Bid| $ 35.52
7. 48" No Bid No Bid| $ 45.96
8. 60" No Bid No Bid} $ 78.09

Section V - Nyloplast or Equal, PVC Drain Basins with Lockable Cast Iron Grates

1. 15~ No Bid No Bid} $ 699.00
2. 18” No Bid No Bid} $ 849.00
3. 247 No Bid No Bid] $ 989.00
4. 307 No Bid No Bid} $ 1,489.00

Section VI - HDPE Pipe Perforated Sock Pipe — 20’ Sections - Price per section

Diameter

1. 4” Flexible No Bid No Bid} $ 59.00
2. 4” Rigid No Bid No Bid| $ 27.80
3. 6” Rigid No Bid No Bid| $ 58.00
4. 8” Rigid No Bid No Bid} $ 79.00
5. 10” Rigid No Bid No Bid} $ 109.00
6. 12” Rigid No Bid No Bid| $ 129.00
7. 15” Rigid No Bid No Bid| $ 169.00
8. 18” Rigid No Bid No Bid} $ 229.00
9. 24” Rigid No Bid No Bid| $ 359.00
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Group C2A - Culvert and Ram Neck Piping
Contract Period 01-01-14 through 12-31-14
Renewable Option 01-01-15 through 12-31-15

Hanson Pipe Design Precast Southern Pipe
& Precast & Pipe & Supply

Section VII - HDPE Pipe, 20' Sections
Diameter
2. 15~ Flared End No Bid NoBid | $ 129.00
3. 18~ Flared End No Bid NoBid | § 179.00
4. 24~ Flared End No Bid NoBid | § 219.00
Section VIII - HDPE Perforated Sock Pipe, Flexible - 100 ft. Roll
1. 4" Perforated Under-Drain Stock Pipe No Bid No Bid| $ 59.00
2. 6" Perforated Under-Drain Sock Pipe No Bid No Bid} $ 129.00

Hanson Pipe & Precast

3000 Faulkner Ave

Gulfport, MS 39501

228-863-2000 - voice
228-864-7288 - fax
barry.hatten@lehighhanson.com
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